
2 CORINTHIANS



Jeremiah 12:5  
If you have run with the footmen, and they have 
wearied you, then how can you contend with 
horses?  
And if in the land of peace, in which you trusted, 
they wearied you,  
Then how will you do in the floodplain of the 
Jordan? 

ENDURANCE



John 17:17, 14:6 
Sanctify them by Your truth. Your word is truth.  

Jesus said to him, “I am the way, the truth, and the 
life. No one comes to the Father except through 
Me.  

TRUTH



2 Corinthians 12:15 
And I will very gladly spend and be spent for your 
souls; though the more abundantly I love you, the 
less I am loved. 

OPEN YOUR HEART



Deuteronomy 22:10 
You shall not plow with an ox and a donkey 
together. 

UNEQUALLY YOKED



1 Kings 11:4  
For it was so, when Solomon was old, that his 
wives turned his heart after other gods; and his 
heart was not loyal to the Lord his God, as was the 
heart of his father David.  

UNEQUALLY YOKED



The word accord gives us our English word 
“symphony,” and it speaks of beautiful music that 
comes when the players are reading the same 
score and obeying the same leader. Warren Wiersbe 

ACCORD



1 Corinthians 3:16 
Do you not know that you are the temple of God 
and that the Spirit of God dwells in you? 

1 Corinthians 6:19 
Or do you not know that your body is the temple of 
the Holy Spirit who is in you, whom you have from 
God, and you are not your own? 

TEMPLE



John 14:23 
Jesus answered and said to him, “If anyone loves 
Me, he will keep My word; and My Father will love 
him, and We will come to him and make Our home 
with him.” 

TEMPLE



Isaiah 52:11 
Depart! Depart! Go out from there, Touch no 
unclean thing; Go out from the midst of her, Be 
clean, You who bear the vessels of the Lord. 

COME OUT


